
 

2022 Outlook – Equities (Joe Williams) 
12/15/21 

 

 

Chris: 

Welcome to Conversations with Commerce Trust Company. This is where our investment team covers 
some added insights from our annual Outlook. Today, we have Joe Williams, our chief investment 
strategist. Joe, looking at the outlook for 2022, you remain quite optimistic on equity performance, even 
following gains of over 31% in 2019, over 18% in 2020, and 25% so far in 2021. Isn't it time for a 
correction? 

Joe: 

Chris, we are still optimistic for stock prices as we enter 2022. Some of the reasons are the economy 
remains quite strong. We're slowing somewhat in 2022, but we still expect gross domestic product that's  
economic growth to be at 4%, versus 5.5% last year. But 4% is still very high on a historical basis. 
Earnings in 2021 are expected to grow at 65 to 70%, granted from very depressed earnings 2020, but 
twice as fast as originally expected at the beginning of 2021. 

Companies have navigated well through COVID, variant restrictions, major supply chain disruptions, and 
labor shortages. But we believe earnings can gain another 10 to 15% in 2022, which is a very nice 
backdrop for stronger stock prices. Another positive we see is the amount of liquidity that's been 
supplied by the government and the Federal Reserve, and where that liquidity is going to end up. This 
liquidity surge in the U.S. is also evident worldwide. 

In many ways, options for investors to invest this money remain the same as a year ago. Money market 
funds currently yield zero, at least for now. Total bond returns were negative in 2021, around minus 
1.5%, and they looked like they could be negative again in 2022. We have a 10-year treasury yielding 
1.5% with inflation at 6.8%, giving an investor a negative 5.3% rate of return, which doesn't sound great. 
But on stocks, on the other hand, we have a 1.3% dividend yield that's increasing, earnings that are 
increasing. And we think that they are the most compelling option investors have to beat inflation this 
year. 

Chris: 

Joe, I think you said the magic word there. Inflation. You have to say that inflation is aggressively turned 
up. I think that's fair. Inflation is nearing 7%. Won't this have a negative impact on earnings and 
valuations? 

 



 

 

Joe: 

Well, yes. High persistent inflation is a problem eventually for stock prices. But in the early phases of 
inflation, it can be a tailwind for earnings growth. The key is whether companies can pass through cost 
increases to their customers, or do they absorb those cost increases through lower profit margins? So 
far as inflation has crept up, companies have been able to pass those cost increases through, and it's 
been driving profit margins actually higher. 

This will eventually change. But at the current time, it's a real positive earnings growth in 2022. Now, 
over a longer period, inflation does cause price earnings ratio...that's how we measure the valuation of 
the market, to decline. And this could be a possible headwind as we approach mid-year. Every 1% 
increase in the long-term expectation for inflation potentially could reduce the price earnings level by 5 
to 10%. So if earnings now are at 20 times earnings, and inflation longer term expectations increase 1%, 
we could see earnings drop to 19 or 18 (times), which could reduce your stock returns next year. 

Chris: 

Joe, we said in our outlook that a rising interest rate scenario does not necessarily mean the end of the 
equity bull market. I've always heard when the federal reserve starts to increase interest rates that 
economic recoveries lose steam. Could that be the case in 2022? 

Joe: 

Well, economic recoveries don't... out on their own, but recoveries turn into recession following 
numerous federal reserve interest rate hikes. Now, this is true. Interest rates hikes have a long lead time 
before the economy is affected. Currently, investors believe we could see the first rate hike in the 
spring, and that will spell trouble for stock prices. In fact, historically, stocks increase into the first rate 
hike. Stock prices are a bit more mixed after that first rate increase, but generally higher for another one 
to two years as rates continue to increase. 

Chris: 

Well, I would say even though the sharp rebound has slowed a little bit, the domestic markets seem to 
be the place to be. Are they going to outperform international markets? 

Joe: 

We do believe international market will continue to underperform the U.S. market again this year. 
Probably not the underperformance that we saw in 2021. The reason for the underperformance, again, 
centers around the mismatch and weighting of technology stocks in the S&P 500s, and the EAFE Index. 
And that's Europe, Australia, and far east, which is a large cap international index. In the S&P 500, 
technology represents 29% of the index versus 10% for international index. If we throw in Alphabet, the 
old Google, Meta Platform, the old Facebook, and Amazon, we're up to about 35% of the S&P 500. 



 

Technology continues to outperform the heavily weighted financial and industrial sectors in the EAFE 
Index. Our long-term target that we use in the trust department is 30% of the portfolio weight in 
international securities. Last year, we recommended a 20% weight. And as we entered 2022, we have 
reduced that farther to 15%. Also on emerging markets, which is included in our international 
weightings, they look inexpensive. And again, emerging markets would be mainly China, Russia, India, 
Brazil. But until we see a clearer outlook of what the Chinese government does with regulation of 
private companies, we expect emerging markets, which incurred a negative return in 2021, to continue 
to underperform as we go through 2022. 

Chris: 

Joe, thank you very much for the analysis. This was Conversations with the Commerce Trust Company 
with Joe Williams.  

 

Commerce Trust Company is a division of Commerce Bank. Important material disclosures regarding the 
content of this call will follow. Generally, non-depository investments offered in connection with 
Commerce Bank and its affiliates are not guaranteed, are not FDIC insured, and may lose value. 
Information provided is effective as of today, December the 15th, 2021, and is presented by the purpose 
of general education, information, or illustration only. 

It is not to be considered as the opinion of Commerce Trust Company or Commerce Bank regarding any 
individual investment, investment account, or market behavior. Neither Commerce, nor any of its 
affiliates, officers, employees, or agents have made any recommendation or given any advice as to the 
terms, beneficial interest, or profitability of any investment or market activity, which may be referenced 
here. And this information may not be relied upon as such. 

Accordingly, you understand that you are always fully responsible for any investment transaction you 
choose to enter into, and that you shall not have relied only on any of the proceedings or following 
information for Commerce as a basis for any investment decision. In considering whether to trade or 
invest, you should inform yourself and be aware of the risks. The risk of loss from investing in securities 
and other investments can be substantial. You should consider whether investments entered into 
directly by you, or on a discretionary managed basis through Commerce Trust Company or elsewhere, 
are appropriate for you in light of your investment objectives, financial circumstances, tax status, your 
tolerance to risk, investment time horizon, and your investment experience. 

Past performance is no guarantee of future results. And the opinions and other information in the 
commentary provided as of this data are subject to change. Diversification does not guarantee a profit 
or protect against all risks. Markets economic forecast and aspects of specific investments can change 
from time to time based on a variety of individual interrelated or complex factors. This disclosure 
statement cannot present all the risks and other significant aspects of investments, economies, or 



 

markets in which you may elect to transact from time to time. You should therefore carefully study 
investment arrangements in advance of making decisions about investing. 

Providing this information, which may be of value to you or others, does not detract from an investor's 
responsibility to take all such steps and make all such inquiries as may be necessary to ensure full 
understanding and familiarity with any potential future investment. If you are in doubt about the risks 
involved in trading or investment arrangements, or have not understood any aspect of this risk 
disclosure statement, you should seek independent professional advice. Please also note that 
Commerce does not offer tax, legal, or specific-to-state planning advice. And while we may provide 
information or express general opinions from time to time, such information or opinions are not offered 
as professional tax or legal advice. 
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